
Gunjan Sharma <gunjan.sharma@travanya.com>

Final confirmation for Flight //Mr.Ravindernath Budala//Inquiry ID:2735
6 messages

Travanya .com <support@travanya.com> Mon, May 27, 2024 at 1:06 PM
To: ravinder.budala@gmail.com
Cc: Operation <ops@travanya.com>, Gunjan Sharma <gunjan.sharma@travanya.com>, Devesh Kumar
<devesh@travanya.com>

Dear Sir,
Greetings from Travanya.com
 
Kindly give the go ahead as per the below details.

Title Surname name
Mr BUDALA RAVINDERNATH
Ms BUDALA SUM RAVINDER

Please revert to the same email loop, using “Reply All” for better coordination. 

Thanks & Regards,
Rakshit
Team - Holidays
Email id: support@travanya.com
Plot No 16 I 2nd Floor I HSIDC IT Park, Panchkula, Haryana  
WhatsApp No - +918284844471 -- Contact Number: 0172-5204000 EXTN - 
Website - https://www.travanya.com

Travanya

Ravindernath Budala <ravinder.budala@gmail.com> Mon, May 27, 2024 at 1:15 PM
To: support@travanya.com
Cc: ops@travanya.com, gunjan.sharma@travanya.com, devesh@travanya.com

Go ahead

[Quoted text hidden]

Ravindernath Budala <ravinder.budala@gmail.com> Mon, May 27, 2024 at 1:16 PM
To: support@travanya.com
Cc: ops@travanya.com, gunjan.sharma@travanya.com, devesh@travanya.com

Please go ahead.

On Mon, 27 May, 2024, 1:06 pm Travanya .com, <support@travanya.com> wrote:
[Quoted text hidden]
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Travanya .com <support@travanya.com> Mon, May 27, 2024 at 3:06 PM
To: Ravindernath Budala <ravinder.budala@gmail.com>
Cc: ops@travanya.com, gunjan.sharma@travanya.com, devesh@travanya.com

Dear Sir,
Greetings from Travanya!!!
 
Kindly give the go ahead as per the below details.

Title Surname Name
Mr BUDALA RAVINDERNATH
Ms BUDALA SUMA RAVINDER

Total cost of Package @INR 1,31,000/-
Payment Received : @INR 67,000/-
Pending payment :  @INR  64,000/-

Destination Singapore
Duration 04nights 05Days 
No. of People 2 Adults 
Date 27th June 2024-01th July 2024  

Hotel             :Value Hotel Thomson
Rooming       :Superior
No. of Nights :04
Meal Plan      : 04 Breakfast  

Package Inclusions   

Daily breakfast
04 nights accommodation at hotel
Airfare Include  
Night Safari tour on seat-in-coach basis  
Singapore Familiarisation Drive on seat-in-coach basis  
Sentosa Saver (01 way cable car with Sentosa cable line + Luge & Skyride (03 rides) + Wings of
time 0740pm) on seat-in-coach basis  
Gardens By The Bay + Sands Sky Park Observation Deck on seat-in-coach basis  
All tours & transfers on seat-in-coach basis  
Return airport transfers on seat-in-coach basis 
All tour and transfers on SIC basis 
TCS 5% included    

  Exclusions  

Any Kind of Personal Expenses or Optional Tours / Extra Meals Ordered
Services of local tour guide    
Tips, Insurance, Laundry, Phone Calls.
Any kind of drinks (Alcohol, Aerated) 
Note: The flight fare and land package cost is separate and is subject to availability     
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Cancellation Policy
30+ Days from DOT - Non-refundable Component
30 to 15 Days from DOT - Non-refundable component + 50% of land package 
15 to 7 Days from DOT - Non-refundable component + 75% of land package 
15 days from DOT - 100% of Package Cost      

Flight Cancellation & Date change Charges

Cancelation before departure - 17000/person
Cancelation After departure - Non refundable

Date change before departure - 13000 + Fare difference/person
Date change before departure - Not possible

Please revert to the same email loop, using “Reply All” for better coordination. 

Thanks & Regards,
Rakshit
Team - Holidays
Email id: support@travanya.com
Plot No 16 I 2nd Floor I HSIDC IT Park, Panchkula, Haryana  
WhatsApp No - +918284844471 -- Contact Number: 0172-5204000 EXTN - 
Website - https://www.travanya.com

Travanya
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[Quoted text hidden]

Ravindernath Budala <ravinder.budala@gmail.com> Mon, May 27, 2024 at 3:41 PM
To: support@travanya.com
Cc: ops@travanya.com, gunjan.sharma@travanya.com, devesh@travanya.com

Go ahead

[Quoted text hidden]

Travanya .com <support@travanya.com> Wed, Jun 19, 2024 at 6:21 PM
To: Gunjan Sharma <gunjan.sharma@travanya.com>

Hi mam

Please revert to the same email loop, using “Reply All” for better coordination. 

Thanks & Regards,
Rakshit
Team - Holidays
Email id: support@travanya.com
Plot No 16 I 2nd Floor I HSIDC IT Park, Panchkula, Haryana  
WhatsApp No - +918284844471 -- Contact Number: 0172-5204000 EXTN - 
Website - https://www.travanya.com

Travanya

[Quoted text hidden]
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